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Press Release 

 

Katz Secures 5th site for Cooper’s Hawk Winery & Restaurants in Ft. Lauderdale 

Grand Opening Today 

Boca Raton, FL, August 12, 2019 – Cooper’s Hawk Winery & Restaurants is set to 
open on Monday, August 12th at The Galleria Mall in Fort Lauderdale.  Located at 
2568 East Sunrise Boulevard, the stunning Winery and Restaurant will occupy 15,091 
square feet.     
 
David Emihovich, Managing Partner of Katz & Associates, secured the 10-year lease 
on behalf of the company and has been the exclusive South Florida broker for 
Cooper’s Hawk since 2012 completing deals in Coconut Creek, Doral, Pembroke 
Pines, Naples and Palm Beach Gardens. Kim Salvatori from JLL represented the 
landlord.  
 

With the opening of The Galleria Mall location, the award-winning restaurant and 
Napa-style tasting room will own and operate 38 restaurants and tasting rooms, 
including 10 Florida locations with three in Broward County. Three additional 
Cooper’s Hawk locations are scheduled to open across the U.S. for the balance of 
2019. 
 
“It’s been a wonderful experience working with such a great company and helping 
with their Florida expansion,” said David Emihovich.  
 
About Katz & Associates 

 
Katz & Associates began operations in January of 1996. The company currently 
maintains offices in New York, Charlotte, Boca Raton, Long Island, Miami, Naples, 
Nashville, New Jersey and Orlando. Katz & Associates’ primary focus is assisting 
retailers, restaurants and landlords in all capacities including; strategic planning, 
market analysis, lease and sale negotiations and dispositions. Our team of seasoned 
veterans has decades of experience and invaluable market knowledge. 
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About Cooper’s Hawk Winery & Restaurants 

Founded in 2005 by CEO Tim McEnery, Cooper’s Hawk Winery & Restaurants is built 
upon the belief that food and wine hold the power to forge lasting connections. 
Cooper’s Hawk is a lifestyle brand centered around wine and focused on creating 
memorable moments that enrich lives. The concept is a fusion of familiar elements 
― modern casual restaurant, Napa-style tasting room and artisanal retail market ― 
that has combined to create an entirely new hospitality experience.  
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